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Introduction

The recovery paradigm has reformed mental health policy 
around the world over the last 30 years (Pincus et al., 
2016). Despite its proliferation as the guiding vision for 
mental health systems, consensus on the definition of 
recovery has been elusive (Ellison et al., 2018). The differ-
ing conceptualizations have been described as ‘recovery 
from’ versus ‘recovery in’ mental illness (Davidson & 
Roe, 2007). In the former, recovery involves symptom 
management and amelioration to a pre-illness state, 
whereas recovery in mental illness refers to people living 
their lives and pursuing personal hopes and aspirations 
despite ongoing illness. Still, for the most marginalized 
people with mental illness, neither conceptualization may 
fully capture the recovery process.

Rates of housing instability and unemployment are dis-
proportionally higher among people with mental illness than 
in the general population (Folsom et al., 2005; Marwaha & 
Johnson, 2004). Despite this, conceptualizations of recovery 

have largely neglected how poverty may restrict people from 
living the lives that they want (Padgett et al., 2016; Sylvestre 
et al., 2018). For example, research has shown that home-
lessness and adulthood victimization are detrimental to 
recovery (Castellow et al., 2015; Karadzhov et al., 2020; 
Kerman, Sylvestre, et al., 2019; Stumbo et al., 2015). Further, 
the stability provided by safe and affordable housing, with 
the necessary supports, can be the foundation to recovery for 
people with serious mental illness (Kirkpatrick & Byrne, 
2009; Padgett, 2007; D. P. Watson & Rollins, 2015). 
Supported housing may also foster recovery by enabling 
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people with mental illness to construct new identities and 
meaning in life; foster choice and control; and reconnect 
with families, friends and communities (Piat et al., 2019; J. 
Watson et al., 2018). As such, housing with supports can be 
a catalyst for recovery; however, less is known about the 
recovery processes of people with mental illness during 
homelessness.

A range of services has been developed to meet the 
complex and varied needs of people experiencing home-
lessness. However, past research has minimally examined 
the effects of service use on recovery among homeless 
people with mental illness (Kerman et al., 2016). In addi-
tion, services may also hinder recovery when people have 
negative experiences or their needs are not met. People 
experiencing homelessness commonly encounter a range 
of barriers to accessing and receiving adequate health care 
(e.g., lacking identification, feeling stigmatized, being 
neglected or overlooked; Hwang, 2001; Kerman, Gran-
Ruaz, et al., 2019; Martins, 2008; Wise & Phillips, 2013). 
Negative service experiences and access barriers may fur-
ther limit the available treatment and care options, thereby 
impeding recovery. As such, there is a critical need to bet-
ter understand the role of health and social services in the 
recovery processes of people with mental illness and histo-
ries of homelessness.

This qualitative study investigated how currently and 
formerly homeless (hereinafter referred to as ‘housed’) 
people with mental illness viewed their service use to be 
helpful or unhelpful to their recovery. Accordingly, two 
research questions were addressed: (1) How do partici-
pants perceive services as affecting their recovery? and (2) 
Do the perceptions of homeless and housed participants 
differ on the relationship between service use and recov-
ery? For this study, recovery was conceptualized as an 
individualized process toward living a full and meaningful 
life that may or may not involve an improvement in mental 
health symptoms.

Method

Recruitment and sample

This study used a convenience sample comprising of 
adults with mental health problems who were homeless or 
housed. Inclusion criteria were (1) a diagnosis of a mental 
disorder or acknowledgment of a mental health problem 
(i.e., self-report), (2) currently or formerly homeless (i.e., 
one or more nights spent in an emergency shelter or on the 
street during their lifetime), (3) 18 years or older and (4) 
fluency in English. Participants were recruited using 
recruitment posters via an emergency shelter, a supportive 
housing program, and an intensive case management team 
located in a large Canadian city.

Of the 54 participants who took part, two were excluded 
from the analysis (one withdrew and one had poor quality 

and unreliable data). Data from 52 participants (homeless: 
n = 26; housed: n = 26) were analyzed. All participants pro-
vided written informed consent and received a CAD $25 
honorarium. The study was approved by the research eth-
ics board of the authors’ institution.

Data collection

In-depth interviews using a three-part, semi-structured 
guide were completed with participants. The first part elic-
ited narratives from participants related to their service use 
(e.g., ‘Can you tell me about a time when you used a ser-
vice with which you had a very positive experience?’). 
Part two of the interview explored the impacts of partici-
pants’ current service use (e.g., ‘What do these services 
allow you to do in life?’ ‘What parts of your life do the 
services that you use not help with?’). Using a mental 
health recovery framework informed by Davidson et al. 
(2005) and Jacobson and Greenley (2001), the third part of 
the interview involved a discussion of if and how the ser-
vices that participants used were helpful to fostering 
recovery (e.g., ‘How do the services that you use help you 
to feel hopeful about life and things to come?’). A contact 
summary, as outlined by Miles et al. (2014), was com-
pleted after each interview to document salient informa-
tion related to the study’s research questions, unclear parts 
of the interview and any comments on data quality. On 
average, interviews were slightly longer than 75 minutes 
and each was audio-recorded. A survey was also com-
pleted with participants to gather information on their gen-
der, age, housing, mental health, substance use and medical 
conditions.

Data collection occurred in two phases between October 
2016 and October 2017. The first phase involved inter-
views with 15 participants to gain an initial sense of how 
people perceive the role of services in their lives, as well as 
how services were linked to components of recovery. The 
interviews were then transcribed, and the quality and con-
tent of the data were evaluated. This process helped to 
determine whether the study methods were suitable for 
exploring the research questions and if changes were 
needed. Small changes were subsequently made to the data 
collection materials (e.g., minor wording changes, addi-
tion of follow-up interview guide questions). The second 
phase of data collection then commenced with the revised 
tools. Summaries were also developed for each interview 
during the second phase of data collection.

Data analysis

All interviews were transcribed verbatim and then 
uploaded into NVivo 11 for analysis. A start list of deduc-
tive, recovery-related codes was then developed based on 
common components of recovery (Davidson et al., 2005; 
Jacobson & Greenley, 2001). Data analysis followed the 
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procedures of first and second cycle coding as outlined by 
Saldaña (2013). First cycle coding involved line-by-line, 
descriptive coding of each transcript. Throughout the first 
cycle, provisional codes were modified and expanded, and 
additional codes and subcodes were added. Second cycle 
coding involved pattern coding to reorganize and condense 
data into a smaller list of broader categories and themes 
(Miles et al., 2014). All coding was completed by the lead 
author. To ensure the credibility of the themes and com-
pleteness of the findings, these were then compared to the 
summaries of each interview.

Results

The background characteristics of the sample are displayed 
in Table 1. Thematic analysis identified five themes related 
to how participants perceive health and social services as 
affecting their recovery (see Table 2). Services had mostly 
positive impacts with regard to several recovery themes, 
such as finding ways to cope and get by, feeling less alone 
and giving back. In contrast, the theme of being dehuman-
ized or seen as someone involved polarizing service expe-
riences. The final theme, encountering restrictions when 
getting help, highlighted how service systems impeded 
recovery. Each theme was present in the transcripts of 
homeless and housed participants, though there were a few 
differences in the prominence of certain subthemes 
between the two groups. A total of 18 participants are rep-
resented in the 25 quotes presented in the results.

Theme 1: finding ways to cope and get by

Mental health services had an important role in helping 
participants to cope with their symptoms and living envi-
ronments. Having access to medications and learning cop-
ing strategies were identified as two ways that services 
were helpful. Pharmacological interventions were needed 
for a range of difficulties, including stabilizing mood, 
managing chronic pain, preventing withdrawal symptoms 
and sleeping in a communal emergency shelter. Drawbacks 
were also raised by some participants who described long 
periods of feeling imprisoned by their medications. Said 
one housed participant of being on methadone for 25 years, 
‘It gives you that freedom [to function] but it also takes it 
away because you’re dependent on it. It’s like liquid hand-
cuffs’. As for coping, participants reported that they had 
learned skills in therapy and counseling that were useful 
for their recovery. Being able to use learned coping skills 
wherever and whenever was also highlighted as facilitat-
ing a sense of control, especially by housed participants: 
‘To be the one who had the skills and executed them . . . I 
found that really, really empowering because I didn’t have 
to rely on anyone else to do it once I learned the skills’.

Participants viewed direct service providers as instru-
mental in fostering hope through encouragement and an 

orientation toward the future. Words of encouragement 
from service providers, as well as recognizing progress, 
were reminders to participants experiencing homelessness 
that somebody believed in them and made their reality of 
day-to-day survival slightly more tolerable: ‘It gives you 
that little, tiny bit of hope that, maybe, you’ll get through 
tonight and tomorrow will be a different day’. Housed par-
ticipants who were receiving ongoing support, such as 
intensive case management, emphasized the importance of 
working collaboratively with service providers to discuss 
future plans and goals: ‘It helps feel that one day I am 
going to get off this stuff [methadone]. You know? One 
day I’m going to have a job normally again. And, maybe 
have another kid, I don’t know. Just move on’.

Services could also have triggering environments. The 
availability and visible use of substances at homeless-serving 

Table 1. Demographic, housing and health characteristics of 
sample (N = 52).

Characteristic Homeless 
(n = 26)

Housed 
(n = 26)

n/M %/SD n/M %/SD

Gender
 Male 14 53.8 9 34.6
 Female 12 46.2 16 61.5
 Transgender female 0 0 1 3.9
Age (years) 41.85 8.80 47.62 10.73
Current living situation
 Emergency shelter 26 100.0  
 Supported housing 9 34.6
 Social housing 8 30.8
 Market rent housing 3 11.5
 Supportive housing 3 11.5
  Living with family or 

friends
2 7.7

 Rooming house 1 3.8
Mental health problem
  Unipolar depressive 

disorder/problem
12 46.2 11 42.3

  Post-traumatic stress 
disorder

11 42.3 8 30.8

 Bipolar disorder 5 19.2 10 38.5
  Anxiety disorder/

problem
8 30.8 7 26.9

  Attention-deficit and 
hyperactivity disorder

7 26.9 5 19.2

 Schizophrenia 3 11.5 4 15.4
 Personality disorder 4 15.4 2 7.7
Problematic substance use 17 65.4 15 57.7
Number of chronic 
medical conditions

1.85 2.31 2.38 3.45

SD: standard deviation.
Supported housing refers to delinked housing and support (i.e., tenants 
can leave their housing and retain their support services), whereas 
housing and support were linked in supportive housing.
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organizations could create problems for participants who 
were abstinent or working to reduce their substance use. 
Because housed participants had more help-seeking options 
than those experiencing homelessness, they were more able 
to avoid services that could be triggering. In contrast, some 
homeless participants described having no choice but to 
accept support from services that were triggering to them.

Theme 2: feeling less alone

Social isolation was a prominent concern among both 
homeless and housed participants who described similar 
ways in which services were beneficial for promoting con-
nectedness. Visiting services to connect to other people 
with lived experience (e.g., homelessness, mental illness, 
problematic substance use) was a way of accessing mutual 
support and making friends. Self-help groups and group 
counseling were identified as offering support from peers 
who were supportive and understanding. The sharing of 
experiences could serve as a reminder to participants that 
they were not alone in what they were going through: 
‘Sometimes it can lift you up a little bit and realize you are 
not alone anymore; you’re not the only one’. Emergency 
shelters also offered social opportunities, though some 
participants reported drawbacks of friendships with other 
people experiencing homelessness, such as risk of theft 
and exploitation. Further, the importance of focusing on 
personal issues and goals was raised: ‘I try not to make a 
lot of friends when I come into the shelters and stuff 
because you have to worry about what you have to do and 
not what everyone else is trying to do’.

Community services also enabled some participants to 
connect with family, particularly when services, often 
libraries, offered computers and internet access. Spiritual 
and cultural services were another type of service that 

participants used to connect to family. In some cases, it 
was accompanying family to church and other faith groups. 
For others, attending spiritual and cultural services 
achieved closeness to deceased family: ‘I go for my mom. 
Because my mom’s dead and I miss her a lot’.

Relationships between service users and providers 
could also help people feel less alone. Participants pointed 
to the value of emotionally supportive relationships with 
key service providers, such as case workers, doctors or 
counselors, who were on their side. Said one housed par-
ticipant of her mental health case manager, ‘I knew that I 
had at least one person in my corner . . . I don’t think I 
would have been able to go to treatment the last time, the 
one that helped me stay clean, without them’. The reliabil-
ity of relationships with service providers during tumultu-
ous periods of people’s lives, which often involved social 
support losses, was also discussed: ‘The one thing through 
all of that – my friends bailed, everybody bailed – I had 
that case worker’.

Theme 3: giving back

Services that offered volunteer or employment opportuni-
ties provided a way for current and former service users to 
give back. Housed participants described helping out at 
programs that were important to their own recovery: ‘I am 
an employee of the shelter that I used to stay in. I volunteer 
for a not-for-profit that means something to me’. Because 
employment was not feasible for all given people’s disabil-
ities or work restrictions of disability income programs, 
some were focused on giving back through volunteering: 
‘What’s important to me is being a part of society. So, if I 
can’t work then I will volunteer’. Another unique way that 
participants gave back was through their involvement in 
advocacy and service delivery activities. Involvement in 

Table 2. Identified themes and subthemes, and related components of recovery.

Theme Subthemes Components of recovery

Finding ways to 
cope and get by

Having skills or medication to function
Being encouraged and looking ahead
Abstaining from substance use at and around homeless-
serving organizations

Symptom management
Hope

Feeling less alone Finding peers with shared experiences
Connecting to family
Having at least one person on your side

Connectedness to others
Mutual support

Giving back Helping out at a program as a volunteer or paid employee
Informing service delivery and participating in advocacy

Involvement in meaningful 
activities and social roles

Being dehumanized 
or seen as someone

Being treated with or without respect
Being seen as a person versus defined by a mental illness, 
substance use problem or living situation

Respect and acceptance
Redefined self

Encountering 
restrictions when 
getting help

Having limited choice and options of treatment and care
Abiding by service rules and requirements
Using a service without knowing what else is available

Control and choice over 
life choices
Self-direction

Components of recovery drawn from Ellison et al. (2018).
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program development consultations with service providers 
was perceived ‘to strengthen bonds between service pro-
vider and recipient’.

There were fewer opportunities to give back for home-
less participants due to the instability and unpredictability 
of daily life. However, some discussed contributing in 
ways that did not require commitments (e.g., cleaning and 
tidying up at a shelter) or were planning to give back in the 
future. Helping out at services during an episode of home-
lessness could also reinforce a sense of personhood: ‘It 
makes you feel like you’re somebody’.

Theme 4: being dehumanized or seen as 
someone

The interpersonal interactions involved in service use were 
a key part of participants’ experiences that could affect 
their perceptions of self-worth, as well as their views of 
health and social services. Participants described polariz-
ing experiences when using services that ranged from 
being deprived human dignity to being seen as a person 
and treated fairly and with respect. The verbal and nonver-
bal communication of service providers contributed to per-
ceptions of the level of respect in treatment and care. 
Overhearing stigmatizing language and comments (e.g., 
‘junkie’, ‘street person’, ‘you’re here again’), being spo-
ken to in a patronizing or belittling way, perceiving favor-
itism and feeling ignored or dismissed were common 
experiences of disrespect. Although experiences of dis-
crimination were discussed by both homeless and housed 
participants, homelessness was an additional and more vis-
ible reason for discrimination (e.g., being unable to pro-
vide a fixed address when completing paperwork, wearing 
worn clothing). Fair and respectful treatment experiences 
were described as an absence of disrespectful communica-
tion, being greeted with welcoming comments, the estab-
lishment of zero tolerance policies for violence and 
discrimination and personal care that is the same as other 
service users.

The importance of being seen for who people are and 
not being defined by a mental illness, substance use prob-
lem or living situation was also discussed. However, 
almost all participants described past service experiences 
in which they had experienced discrimination because of 
their health or poverty. Among participants who currently 
or formerly used substances, there was an expressed sense 
of being ‘marked’ at medical services. Homeless partici-
pants also described discrimination in the form of ‘half-
assed’ treatment and care, and experiences of feeling like a 
number in the shelter system or not being seen as a person 
at all.

Despite the experiences involving stigma and discrimi-
nation, participants also described some service providers 
as helping them to regain or maintain their sense of per-
sonhood. This was achieved when providers knew service 

users’ names, asked questions, were honest and expressed 
their concerns, made compassionate gestures (e.g., staying 
late to talk, offering food or a drink when meeting), saw 
and commented on strengths and used person-first lan-
guage. Person-centered program policies and approaches, 
including accommodating people who are intoxicated, 
were also identified as helping participants to be seen for 
who they are.

Theme 5: encountering restrictions when 
getting help

Barriers to treatment and care were common experiences 
that could impede recovery. Participants described limited 
to no choice, and inflexible program rules and require-
ments as restrictions they experienced when accessing ser-
vices. Limited treatment and care options were commonly 
discussed in the context of opioid substitution therapy, 
which could lead to a pattern of self-medication with illicit 
substances: ‘They’re trying to prescribe me other medica-
tions to help the things I’m already helping with the medi-
cations that I have chosen’. Service options were more 
limited for participants experiencing homelessness; how-
ever, a lack of choice was also experienced by housed par-
ticipants as a result of unmet basic needs: ‘Poverty line is 
around $18,000, we make $10,000 [on disability income] 
. . . I have no choice but to access the food bank or the 
drop-in center’.

A lack of information and transparency about available 
services also prevented participants from being able to 
make choices and achieve a sense of control in treatment 
and care decisions. This barrier was linked to income sup-
port programs and overworked case managers. Some par-
ticipants reported that they only learned of available 
options when they pursued the information: ‘If you don’t 
know what you’re entitled to, they won’t tell you’. 
Uncommunicative service providers forced participants to 
solve problems on their own: ‘You almost have to find 
your own answers to your own questions’. Some service 
users also felt unable to speak up because they were unin-
formed: ‘You don’t question that because you do not know 
better. It’s his job, he decides’.

Program rules and requirements was another restriction 
of service use, which were commonly ascribed to home-
less-serving organizations. Challenges arose from inflexi-
ble hours of operation and requirements for service use 
(e.g., attending a chapel service to receive a meal at the 
soup kitchen, taking psychotropic medication to receive a 
service). Most participants described abiding by rules out 
of fear of service loss. The greatest concern was being 
banned from a service, as this would further reduce treat-
ment and care options. This fear could make participants 
feel powerless and voiceless, especially when they experi-
enced unfair or inadequate treatment: ‘If you react, you get 
kicked out for a day and then you have to go to another 
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shelter. So, there is no point in reacting to it’. Others 
believed that they had no right to speak up or that their 
concerns would be ignored: ‘You have nobody to com-
plain to because, if you do start to complain, well, you’re 
just some homeless guy that’s just crying about something 
that he doesn’t get for free’.

Discussion

The findings from this qualitative study demonstrate how 
services can promote and hinder recovery among currently 
and formerly homeless people with mental illness. Across 
the themes, the interpersonal interactions between service 
users and providers were central to recovery. The findings 
align with research on community mental health service 
delivery that underscores the importance of positive thera-
peutic alliances for recovery (Kidd et al., 2017). As such, 
working relationships that are grounded in trust, respect, 
fairness and honesty are key to providing recovery- 
oriented care to currently and formerly homeless people 
with mental illness. Moreover, as many people with men-
tal illness and histories of homelessness have limited social 
ties and networks (Hawkins & Abrams, 2007; Karadzhov 
et al., 2020; Pahwa et al., 2019), the relationships devel-
oped in service settings may partially compensate for 
unmet social needs.

Extending past research on the negative aspects of ser-
vice delivery for people experiencing mental illness and 
homelessness (Kerman, Gran-Ruaz, et al., 2019; Voronka 
et al., 2014), limited choice and control when seeking help 
was perceived to impede recovery. These findings are 
consistent with those of other studies that have highlighted 
the inflexible rules and requirements of homeless sector 
services, which can be a barrier to accessing adequate sup-
port (Ogden & Avades, 2011; Wusinich et al., 2019). 
However, restrictions were also partially the result of sys-
temic issues related to income support rates being insuffi-
cient to meet basic needs without the assistance of services 
and unaffordability of health care services not covered by 
insurance. A lack of information and transparency also 
undermined service users’ choice and control in treatment 
and care. Accordingly, ensuring that service users know 
and understand what is available to them, as well as their 
rights and responsibilities, would help to reduce informa-
tional barriers. For people experiencing homelessness, ser-
vice providers can work with them to foster their sense of 
choice and control in treatment and care by collaboratively 
identifying needs, helping with system navigation, provid-
ing information and discussing available services and 
addressing concerns related to changing services.

The perspectives of homeless and housed participants 
were similar, though experiences of discrimination, fewer 
opportunities to give back and limited service options were 
heightened among the homeless group. Nevertheless, the 

perceived ways in which services could foster or impede 
recovery were alike between the two groups. The findings 
suggest that participants in this study accessed services to 
address needs related to social connection, health and 
functioning and meaningful activities that are not bound to 
episodes of homelessness. Moreover, as all housed partici-
pants were receiving disability income, it is important to 
recognize that many individuals of this group likely con-
tinue to live in poverty – a finding that has also been iden-
tified in past research on supported housing (Henwood 
et al., 2015). As such, aside from housing, the recovery 
needs of the two groups may be quite similar.

Consistent with past research examining recovery 
among people with mental illness who have histories of 
homelessness (e.g., Choy-Brown et al., 2016; Padgett et al., 
2012, 2016), participants in this study reported experi-
encing many adversities beyond their mental health and 
housing, such as substance use problems, trauma and vic-
timization, chronic medical conditions, incarceration, sex 
work, social isolation and loneliness and food insecurity. 
As such, participants often discussed recovery more 
broadly, holistically considering how services affected their 
various challenges. Moreover, a single service experience 
could be linked to multiple adversities (e.g., feeling stigma-
tized because of substance use and homelessness). These 
findings would support a conceptualization of complex 
recovery, as proposed by Padgett et al. (2016), that refers to 
the cumulative adversities encountered by people with 
mental illness who have histories of homelessness. This 
broader framework is necessary for considering the inter-
connectedness of different adversities and the multiple ser-
vice systems accessed by this population in their recovery.

The findings have key implications for change at the 
systems level. As previously asserted by Manning and 
Greenwood (2018), there is value to using a recovery-ori-
ented approach within the homeless service system. 
Although housing is a foundation to recovery, homeless 
services can support the recovery journeys of people with 
mental illness during the process of finding and obtaining 
housing. This can be done by providing opportunities for 
people experiencing homelessness to be heard, emotion-
ally supported and validated. In addition, working with 
service users who wish to give back and finding ways to 
include them in service delivery and advocacy work would 
help to foster meaningful social roles. As readiness for 
change toward a recovery orientation in the homeless sec-
tor service is low (Manning & Greenwood, 2019), mental 
health systems have an important capacity building role 
in recovery. After people exit homelessness, providing 
access to wraparound supports that use a trauma-informed 
approach, which aligns with a recovery model (Mihelicova 
et al., 2018), would be beneficial to addressing basic needs 
associated with poverty that may impede the recovery 
journeys of people with mental illness.
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This study had several limitations. First, because a 
convenience sample was used and completion of the 
study took approximately 75–90 minutes, it is possible 
that participants’ level of functioning was above average 
for this population. Second, the study had a qualitative 
design, with participants being interviewed only once. As 
a result, housed participants may have had different ser-
vice experiences during homelessness than the partici-
pants in the homeless group. Third, all homeless 
participants were recruited from an emergency shelter 
and few housed participants described past episodes of 
unsheltered homelessness. Because of this, the findings 
may be less representative of people with histories of 
unsheltered homelessness. Fourth, this study did not 
measure participants’ level of recovery. It is likely that 
participants had different recovery journeys, which may 
have shaped their perceptions of how services affect 
recovery. Future research should consider examining the 
role of services in the lives of adults with mental illness 
and histories of homelessness who are at different levels 
of recovery.

Conclusion

Health and social services promoted the recovery of cur-
rently and formerly homeless people with mental illness 
by helping them to find ways of cope and get by, provid-
ing opportunities for socialization and connection and 
making available opportunities to contribute and give 
back. Although services could also have positive impacts 
on recovery by seeing service users for who they were, 
too commonly this was not the case as participants often 
felt defined by their health conditions or living situations 
when accessing services. Restrictions related to seeking 
help also impeded recovery. Findings differed minimally 
between the two groups, suggesting that formerly home-
less participants may continue to live in poverty and have 
similar service experiences as those who are homeless. 
Moreover, as participants described experiencing multiple 
life adversities, a broader conceptualization of recovery is 
beneficial for understanding the helpfulness of services in 
promoting recovery for this population.
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